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New System Installation

Profile(s) reviewed, default 
values determined by Nursing 

unit leadership (ND/CNS), 
BME CE and clinical educator.

Deviation 
from 

Standard 
Defaults?

Follow Default Setting 
Process 

New default 
profile?

Default Change
Request

Nursing unit leadership 
submits the default change 

request to Biomed for technical 
review. 

Request submitted for review 
to all ACN's and then to 

Nursing Executive Operations 
for approval.  If approved, 

notification is sent to Biomed 
for implementation.  

Default profile for unit is 
created or updated and stored 

on Biomed website.  Older 
versions are archived.  

Follow Default Setting 
Process 

Software/Hardware 
Upgrade, New Software 

Revision

Equipment Service
(Repair, SM, 

Replacement)

Routine Verification

Prior to upgrade, BME reviews 
upgrade details and test loads 
then reviews defaults in test 

monitor.

Changes
(additions, 

omissions) in 
default profile?

Follow Default Verification 
Process 

After repair, scheduled 
maintenance (SM), or 

installation of a replacement 
monitor (new or loaner), 

defaults are verified.

If discrepancies are found, 
defaults are reset.

During annual surveillance 
rounds, the Biomed 

representative will randomly 
verify defaults and provide 

documentation. 

If discrepancies are found, 
defaults are reset for the entire 

unit.

Follow Default Setting 
Process 

Follow Default Setting 
Process 

Nursing unit leadership 
submits change request with 

Biomed assessment to 
Associate Chief Nurse/ACN.Yes

Yes

Yes

No

No

No
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